FDP Form 10b - Bid Results on Goods and Services

Republic of the Philippines
GOODS AND SERVICES BID-OUT

PROVINCE OF ISABELA
2" Quarter, CY 2018

Approved Budget for

No. Item Description S Winning Bidder Name and Address Of Bidder Bid Amount Date of Bidding
Deep Bedding, Backyard Hog Raising on Mr. Mark Lope H. Hernandez
1 |Organic Fertilizer Production/Organic 2,196,900.00 Gemwealth Construction and Trading Barangay San Pedro, Sto. Tomas, 2,192,070.00 4/2/2018
Vegetable and Tilapia Production Batangas
SUV 4x2 A/T DSL 2400cc. Brand New with 3
2 / ) . 1,997,700.00 Failed Bidding (No bid submitted) N/A N/A 4/2/2018
Years LTO Registration
Mr. Florencio F. Cura
Brand N Fire Truck, 7790CC, M/T, Diesel, . #27 President Quirino Street
3 |Cranafewrire fruc /T, Diese 9,000,000.00  |F.Cura Industries 27 President Quirino Stree 7,380,000.00 4/17/2018
Euro 4 Compliant Life Homes Subdivision
Rosario, Pasig City
) ) ) Mr. Ronald E. Macadangdang
Medical Ambul 4 Cylinder2500cc, Diesel
4 | Vedical Ambuiance % Lylinderaouuce, Diese 6,591,200.00 |Elite North Autocars, Inc. Km 335, Batal, Santiago City 6,591,200.00 4/17/2018
M/T with 3 Years LTO Registration
Isabela
Ms. Rhodora R. Cuajao
5 |Outdoor LED Billboard 5,500,000.00 JOEBZ Computer Sales & Services Brgy. 14, Salazar Street 3,500,250.00 4/17/2018
Tacloban, City
Ms. Irish Jane T. Cristobal
6 [Procurement of Office Supplies 1,689,513.15 Isaiah 8:15 Enterprises #60 Rizal Avenue, District Il 1,688,402.50 4/17/2018
Cauayan City, Isabela
Mr. Gilbert B. Ceralde
7 Procurement of Tarpaulin Printer 3,200,000.00 Y Cube Enterprise Rizal Street, San Vicente 3,050,000.00 4/17/2018
City of Ilagan, Isabela
Mr. Bernabe A. Maddam-Ot
Procurement of Brand New Wheel Loader 1.80
8 cum 10,500,000.00 Civic Merchandising, Inc. #77 Mindanao Ave., 10,440,000.00 4/17/2018
o Pag-asa, Quezon City
Ms. Debby Ann M. Caramancion
9 Procurement of Brand New Excavator, 0.92 10,870,000.00 Compressed Air Machineries and Equipment 707 Comm.onwealth Avenue 5,800,000.00 4/17/2018
cu.m. Corp. Corner Valiant Street
Quezon City
No. Item Description Approzi::::tget oy Winning Bidder Name and Address Of Bidder Bid Amount Date of Bidding
Piglets: Specification: 40 to 50 days Old, 13 to . . . .
10 g P y 1,800,000.00 Second Failed Bidding (No bid submitted) N/A N/A 4/17/2018

15 Kilos bodyweight




Mr. Juan Miguel G. Picar
73 Dama de Noche Street

11 |Jetmatic Pump 2,150,000.00 Jump Engineering Services o o 1,950,000.00 4/17/2018
Twinville Subdivision
Nangka, Marikina City
Pick-Up 4x4 M/T, Diesel with 3 Years LTO . - . .
12 . P . / 1,533,200.00 Failed Bidding (No bid submitted) N/A N/A 4/19/2018
Registration
Pick-Up 4x4 M/T 2.400cc, Diesel with 3 Years . - . .
13 P . _/ 3,066,400.00 Failed Bidding (No bid submitted) N/A N/A 4/19/2018
LTO Registration
AUV 2.8 Diesel, 4 CylinderM/T with 3 Y LTO
14 / 2.8 Diesel, 4 CylinderM/T with 3 Years 1,152,200.00  |Failed Bidding (No bid submitted) N/A N/A 4/19/2018
Registration
AUV 2.8 Diesel, 4 CylinderM/T with 3 Years LTO . i . .
15 . . ¥ / 1,152,200.00 Failed Bidding (No bid submitted) N/A N/A 5/2/2018
Registration
Ms. Elva E. Espino
Medical Gallery Trading Company 1357 Rizal Avenue, Sta. Cruz 1,397,500.00
Manila
Ms. Remilou S. Buenavista
Midway Drug & Medical Supplies Brgy. Osmena, City of llagan 3,051,300.00
Isabela
Ms. Malou P. P
RLT Drug S Vialou V. rascua 1,197,642.40
Bliss Village, City of llagan, Isabela
16 [Drugs & Medicines 22,000,000.00 5/7/2018
Multi-Gas Corporation M.r..Honorlo CTy 1,400,700.00
Alicia, Isabela
Mr. Fernando P. Requinio
Ferma Drug City Road, Dubinan East 2,326,250.00
Santiago City, Isabela
Mr. Felix G. Vi
Lexicon Drug r. Felix G |er.nfes 498,879.80
Cabarroguis, Quirino
No. Item Description Approzz:::gtget for Winning Bidder Name and Address Of Bidder Bid Amount Date of Bidding
Ms. Irish Jane T. Cristobal
Isaiah 8:15 Enterprises #60 Rizal Avenue, District Il 3,537,145.30
Cauayan City, Isabela
Euro Med Laboratories, Philippines, Inc. Ms. .Ma. Crls.tlna April S. Santos 2,002,810.00
Ermita, Manila
RANA Pharmaceutical, Inc. Ms. Bose”é > Co 1,190,350.00
Santiago City, Isabela
16 |Drugs & Medicines 22,000,000.00 5/7/2018
Ms. Aldred Dumelod
201 DMC Bldg., Di d St.
Ellebasy Medicale Trading g blamon 3,372,700.00

CVS Homes-1
Cainta, Rizal




Ms. Rosalinda R. Pagulayan

KRP Enterprises #37 Taft St., Brgy. Sta. Barbara 2,015,650.00
City of llagan, Isabela
Ms. Remilou S. Buenavista
Midway Drug & Medical Supplies Brgy. Osmena, City of Illagan 5,069,770.00
Isabela
Ms. Elva E. Espino
Medical Gallery Trading Company 1357 Rizal Avenue, Sta. Cruz 1,973,200.00
Manila
Ms. Irish Jane T. Cristobal
Isaiah 8:15 Enterprises #60 Rizal Avenue, District I 3,789,540.00
17 |Medical Supplies 20,000,000.00 Cauayan City, Isabela 5/7/2018
Ellebasy Medicale Trading Ms. Aldred Dumelod 2,225,500.00
Cainta, Rizal
RANA Pharmaceutical, Inc. Ms. I.?osellt.e > Co 4,506,093.00
Santiago City, Isabela
Ms. Malou P. P
RLT Drug s Malou ¥, Fascua 2,435,746.00
Bliss Village, City of llagan, Isabela
SUV 4x2 A/T DSL 2400cc. Brand Ne ith 3
18 X2 A/TDSL 24 wwi 1,997,700.00  |Second Failed Bidding (No bid submitted) N/A N/A 6/4/2018
Years LTO Registration
No. Item Description Approzzi:::fet o Winning Bidder Name and Address Of Bidder Bid Amount Date of Bidding
Pick-Up 4x4 M/T, Diesel with 3 Years LTO . o X .
19 X P i / 1,533,200.00 Second Failed Bidding (No bid submitted) N/A N/A 6/4/2018
Registration
Pick-Up 4x4 M/T 2.400cc, Diesel with 3 Y
20 |Pick-Up axa M/ cc, DIeselwith 5 vears 3,066,400.00  |Second Failed Bidding (No bid submitted) N/A N/A 6/4/2018
LTO Registration
AUV 2.8 Diesel, 4 CylinderM/T with 3 'Y LTO A - . .
21 / 2.8 Diesel, 4 CylinderM/T with 3 Years 1,152,200.00  |Second Failed Bidding (No bid submitted) N/A N/A 6/4/2018
Registration
AUV 2.8 Diesel, 4 CylinderM/T with 3 'Y LTO A - . .
22 / 2.8 Diesel, 4 CylinderM/T with 3 Years 1,152,200.00  |Second Failed Bidding (No bid submitted) N/A N/A 6/4/2018
Registration
DOH Compliant Medical Ambulance 4 Cylinder Mr. Ronald E. Macadangdang
23 |2.500cc Diesel M/T with 3 Years LTO 8,700,705.00 Elite North Autocars, Inc. Km 335, Batal, Santiago City 8,700,705.00 6/4/2018
Registration Isabela
DOH Compliant Medical Ambulance 4 Cylinder Mr. Ronald E. Macadangdang
24 12.500cc Diesel M/T with 3 Years LTO 5,800,470.00 Elite North Autocars, Inc. Km 335, Batal, Santiago City 5,800,470.00 6/4/2018
Registration Isabela
Brand New Pick-Up 4x2 Diesel M/T with 1,194 000.00
T Mr. Ronald E. Macadangdan
25 |Additional Accessories and with 3 Years LTO (Supplimental Bid Bulletin [Nissan Commonwealth, Inc. gcang 1,194,000.00 6/4/2018

Registration

No. 001-21)

Pinagbarilan, Baliwag, Bulacan

TOTAL

100,277,874.00




We hereby certify that we have reviewed the contents and hereby attest to the veracity and correctness of the data or information contained in this document.
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