Republic of the Philippines
CIVIL WORKS BID-OUT
PROVINCE OF ISABELA

2" Quarter, CY _2020

Approved Budget for

No. Name of Project S—— Location Winning Bidder/ Lowest Calculated Bidder Name and Address Contract Amount Bidding Date Contract Duration
Construction of Brgy. C ity Center, Brgy. Victoria (2™ Ms. Aurea F. Manuel
1 |-onstruction ot brgy. Lommunity Lenter, Brgy. Victoria 799,953.27 Mallig, Isabela A. F. Manuel Construction #58 Quezon St., Brgy. 02 795,361.15 6/1/2020 29 Calendar Days
Bid) - EDF 2019
San Mateo, Isabela
Construction of Perimeter Fence at Don Mariano Marcos Second Failed Bidding
2 59,960.17 Echague, Isabela i .
National High School (2nd Bid) - SEF 2019 g (No bid submitted) N/A N/A 6/1/2020 18 Calendar Days
Repair of 4-CL Building at San Manuel Elementary School Second Failed Bidding
3 199,935.47 San Manuel, Echague, Isabela i .
(2nd Bid) - SEF 2019 8 (No bid submitted) N/A N/A 6/1/2020 90 Calendar Days
Repair of School Building at San Isidro West Elementary . Second Failed Bidding
4 149,849.99 San Isidro, Isabela X .
school (2nd Bid) - SEF 2019 (No bid submitted) N/A N/A 6/1/2020 30 Calendar Days
Repair of 8-CL Building and Improvement of Exisiting 2" Ms. Aurea F. Manuel
5 |Floor of Multi-Purpose Bldg., San Agustin National High 999,387.77 San Agustin, Isabela A. F. Manuel Construction #58 Quezon St., Brgy. 02 989,670.53 6/1/2020 90 Calendar Days
School (2nd Bid) - SEF 2019 San Mateo, Isabela
Construction of DRRM Office and School Clinic of Diadi Ms. Aurea F. Manuel
6 - 3 : X 499,170.83 Cordon, Isabela A. F. Manuel Construction #58 Quezon St., Brgy. 02 493,612.61 6/1/2020 57 Working Days
Regiion High School, Villamarzo (2nd Bid) - SEF 2019
San Mateo, Isabela
. . . . Second Failed Bidding i
7 |Completion of Community Center (2nd Bid) - EDF 2019 399,582.60 Caloocan, San Agustin, Isabela (No bid submitted) N/A N/A 6/1/2020 30 Working Days
Construction of 1-CL Building at La Salette Elementary La Salette, Benito Soliven, Second Failed Bidding .
8 100,000.00 ) .
School (2nd Bid) - SEF 2019 Isabela (No bid submitted) N/A N/A 6/1/2020 20 Working Days
Mr. Jonathan L. Diaz
9 [Construction of Dairy Barn (2nd Bid) - EDF 2019 999,977.69 San Antonio, Cabagan, Isabela| Dragon Twelve Builders and Construction Supply |Arranz St., Calamagui 2nd 989,820.00 6/1/2020 60 Calendar Days
City of llagan, Isabela
. . Mr. Jonathan L. Diaz
10 |Construction of PDRRMC Command Center, Capitol 4,999,967.70 Alibagu, City of llagan, Isabela | Dragon Twelve Builders and Construction Supply |Arranz St., Calamagui 2nd 4,968,002.36 6/1/2020 120 Calendar Days
Compound (2nd Bid) - PGO CO A
City of llagan, Isabela
VIS, Grace vl I‘(UU[rgUEL
Capitol Compound, City of . . Brgy. M , Maharlik; .
11  |Construction of Halfway House - PGI 4,999,988.92 P P YO | camberwell Construction & Supplies rey. Viagsaysay, Viaharlixa 4,994,777.97 6/8/2020 150 Working Days
llagan, Isabela Highway, Naguilian, Isabela
Construction of Materials Recovery Facility (MRF) Building - Villa Teresita, San Guillermo, First Failed Bidding
12 PGl 296,303.29 lsabela (No bid submitted) N/A N/A 6/8/2020 20 Calendar Days
Construction of Materials Recovery Facility (MRF) Building - Echague District Hospital, First Failed Bidding
13 oG 296,303.29 Echague, Isabela (No bid submitted) N/A N/A 6/8/2020 20 Calendar Days
Construction of Materials Recovery Facility (MRF) Building - Manuel A. Roxas District First Failed Bidding
1 2 2
4 PGI 96,303.29 Hospital, Roxas, Isabela (No bid submitted) N/A N/A 6/8/2020 20 Calendar Days
15 Construction of Materials Recovery Facility (MRF) Building - 296,303.29 Capitol Compound, City of First Failed Bidding N/A N/A 6/8/2020 20 Calendar Days

PGI

llagan, Isabela

(No bid submitted)




Approved Budget for

No. Name of Project Contract Location Winning Bidder/ Lowest Calculated Bidder Name and Address Contract Amount Bidding Date Contract Duration
Construction of Materials Recovery Facility (MRF) Building - GFNDyMemorial Hospital, First Failed Bidding
1 2 2
6 PGI 96,303.29 City of llagan, Isabela (No bid submitted) N/A N/A 6/8/2020 20 Calendar Days
Mr. Jonathan L. Diaz
i i ili ilding - Milagros Albano District
17 |Construction of Materials Recovery Facility (MRF) Building 296,303.29 8 Dragon Twelve Builders and Construction Supply |Arranz St., Calamagui 2nd 294,147.88 6/8/2020 20 Calendar Days
PGI Hospital, Cabagan, Isabela )
City of llagan, Isabela
. . - S Mr. Jonathan L. Diaz
18 Eg?“r““"’" of Materials Recovery Facility (MRF) Building - 296,303.29 Ugad, Cabagan, Isabela | Dragon Twelve Builders and Construction Supply |Arranz St., Calamagui 2nd 294,147.88 6/8/2020 20 Calendar Days
City of llagan, Isabela
Construction of Materials R Facility (MRF) Buildi San Mariano Community First Failed Biddi
19 |-onstruction ot Materials Recovery Facility ufiding 296,303.29 Hospital, San Mariano, Irst Fafled Bidding N/A N/A 6/8/2020 20 Calendar Days
PGI (No bid submitted)
Isabela
. - . . Ms. Aurea F. Manuel
20 ';Ztl"“k'“g of Quirino - Lullutan Road (Sta. Lucia Section) - 4,999,959.49 Quirino, Isabela A. F. Manuel Construction #58 Quezon St., Brgy. 02 4,994,551.73 6/8/2020 60 Calendar Days
San Mateo, Isabela
Bray. Samonte, Quezon Ms. Aurea F. Manuel
21 |Construction of Drainage - PGI 2,536,835.74 : IsabeI; ’ A. F. Manuel Construction #58 Quezon St., Brgy. 02 2,531,898.34 6/8/2020 120 Calendar Days
San Mateo, Isabela
Bray. Minagbag, Quezon Ms. Aurea F. Manuel
22 |Construction of Evacuation Center - PGl 999,908.67 ' Isabelal " |A. F. Manuel Construction #58 Quezon St., Brgy. 02 994,881.10 6/8/2020 90 Calendar Days
San Mateo, Isabela
) ) Mr. Jonathan L. Diaz
I ) Villa Luz, Delfin Albano, . ) .
23 |Rehabilitation of Multi-Purpose Hall - PGI 1,799,998.18 Isabela Dragon Twelve Builders and Construction Supply |Arranz St., Calamagui 2nd 1,786,971.36 6/8/2020 90 Calendar Days
City of llagan, Isabela
i is- Vi i . Dr. Mario Dela F t
24 |Reblocking of San Luis - Villa Concepcion Road (Baculud 5,476,846.23 Cauayan City, Isabela  |MAR-DEB Construction & Dev't. Corp. r. Mario Defa Fuente 5,468,752.02 6/8/2020 60 Working Days
Section) - PGI Cabatuan, Isabela
Rehabilitation and Build Back Better, Expansion of Patient L Mr. Jonathan L. Diaz
o . . . Dicabisagan West, Palanan, . ) )
25 |waiting area of Palanan Station Hospital, Admin. Bldg., 2,197,799.99 |sabela Dragon Twelve Builders and Construction Supply |Arranz St., Calamagui 2nd 2,195,146.62 6/9/2020 150 Calendar Days
Phase 2 - DOH -HFEP City of llagan, Isabela
Construction of Materials Recovery Facility (MRF) Building - Palanan Station Hospital Mr. Jonathan L. Diaz
2 |00 ¥ ¥ g 299,399.35 bolaman feabels | Dragon Twelve Builders and Construction Supply |Arranz St., Calamagui 2nd 297,296.04 6/9/2020 15 Calendar Days
! City of llagan, Isabela
Repair of Eroded Concrete Pavement at Colunguan Section - Mr. Jonathan L. Diaz
27 p X s 899,999.99 Sto. Tomas, Isabela Dragon Twelve Builders and Construction Supply |Arranz St., Calamagui 2nd 894,310.00 6/10/2020 48 Calendar Days
2019 Reprogramming .
City of llagan, Isabela
Mr. Jonathan L. Diaz
i ilapi i Delfin Albano & Sto. Tomas,
2 |Reblocking of Dilapidated Concrete Pavement along Delfin 4,600,000.00 Dragon Twelve Builders and Construction Supply |Arranz St., Calamagui 2nd 4,594,914.00 6/10/2020 59 Calendar Days
Albano - Sto. Tomas Road - 2019 Reprogramming Isabela )
City of llagan, Isabela
. . Mr. Jonathan L. Diaz
2q |Concreting of Bagabag Bridge Approach - 2019 3,000,000.00 Sto. Tomas, Isabela Dragon Twelve Builders and Construction Supply |Arranz St., Calamagui 2nd 2,994,516.40 6/10/2020 49 Calendar Days
Reprogramming .
City of llagan, Isabela
Concreting of Calanigan Bridge Approaches - 2019 Mr. Jonathan L. Diaz
30 RZ :oerarirc:ﬂna aniga g¢ Approaches 450,000.00 Sto. Tomas, Isabela Dragon Twelve Builders and Construction Supply |Arranz St., Calamagui 2nd 444,898.80 6/10/2020 47 Calendar Days
prog 8 City of llagan, Isabela
Concreting of Calinaoan Bridge Ill Approaches - 2019 Mr. Jonathan L. Diaz
31 RZ :oerarigﬂna aoa ge pproaches 750,000.00 Sto. Tomas, Isabela Dragon Twelve Builders and Construction Supply |Arranz St., Calamagui 2nd 744,931.30 6/10/2020 48 Calendar Days
prog 8 City of llagan, Isabela
. . . Mr. Jonathan L. Diaz
32 (ézn:;e:;nri;ﬁsalmaoan Bridge Il Approaches - 2019 299,999.00 Delfin Albano, Isabela Dragon Twelve Builders and Construction Supply |Arranz St., Calamagui 2nd 294,880.00 6/10/2020 47 Calendar Days
prog 8 City of llagan, Isabela
. . . First Failed Bidding
33 |Construction of Gomez Bridge (Phase 1) - PGI 3,999,981.45 San Isidro, Isabela (No bid submitted) N/A N/A 6/11/2020 60 Calendar Days
34 |Concreting of Sta. Luciana - San Antonio Provincial Road, 1,959,945.11 Cauayan City, Isabela | MAR-DEB Construction & Dev't. Corp. Dr. Mario Dela Fuente 1,950,672.20 6/11/2020 30 Working Days

Phase Il - 2019 Reprogramming

Cabatuan, Isabela




Approved Budget for

No. Name of Project Contract Location Winning Bidder/ Lowest Calculated Bidder Name and Address Contract Amount Bidding Date Contract Duration
Construction of Drainage Canal in front of Mabini National First Failed Bidding
35 84,976.33 B . .
High School - PG| Gamu, Isabela (No bid submitted) N/A N/A 6/11/2020 10 Calendar Days
X . Mr. Jonathan L. Diaz
i i ili - Cab 10, City of Il ,
3¢ |Construction of Rattan Processing Center Facility, Phase 1 9,998,598.74 abisera =9, Ly 0T TI883M: | 1 agon Twelve Builders and Construction Supply |Arranz St., Calamagui 2nd 9,991,977.50 6/30/2020 | 454 Working Days
2019 Reprogramming Isabela )
City of llagan, Isabela
. Mr. Jonathan L. Diaz
i i - Brgy. N City of
37 |Construction of Nanaguan Bridge - EDF 2019 5,873,734.99 ry. Nanaguan, LIy of - o 0 on Twelve Builders and Construction Supply |Arranz St., Calamagui 2nd 5,867,811.22 6/30/2020 | 110 Calendar Days
Reprogramming llagan, Isabela )
City of llagan, Isabela
. . Mr. Jonathan L. Diaz
3 |Coneuction of Slope Praection at KM 8+385 1o KM 813691 4,921,084.95 llagan & Divilacan, Isabela | Dragon Twelve Builders and Construction Supply [Arranz St., Calamagui 2nd 4,915,130.80 6/30/2020 | 40 Calendar Days
City of llagan, Isabela
. . Mr. Jonathan L. Diaz
39 |Construction of Slope Pratection at KM 10+860 to KM 905,484.23 llagan & Divilacan, Isabela | Dragon Twelve Builders and Construction Supply |Arranz St., Calamagui 2nd 899,869.20 6/30/2020 30 Calendar Days

10+900 - EDF AB 2020

City of llagan, Isabela

TOTAL

65,682,949.01

We hereby certify that we have reviewed the contents and hereby attest to the veracity and correctness of the data or information contained in this document.
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