CIVIL WORKS BID-OUT
PROVINCE OF ISABELA

_l_s_t_ Quarter, CY __2022

Approved Bﬁdget for

Name ef‘Pmiéct oy Location Winning Bidder/ Lowest Calculated Bidder Name and Address Contract Amount | BiddingDate | Contract Duration
Mr. Jonathan L. Diaz
ti Ffi inci i S i li
1 Ren?va lon of Office of Provincial Agricufture Phase \1 4,999,998.35 Caplt.ol EEmpOnGE, RIS Dragon Twelve Builders and Construction Supply 1Arranz St., Calamagui 2nd 4,995,345,29 1/18/2022 137 Calendar Days
Capital Outlay City of lagan, Isabela .
City of llagan, Isabela
Construction of 10-Units Modular Steel Isolation Facility at Mr. Jonathan L. Diaz
2 |GFND Sr. Memorial Hospital - 2,999,999.50 City of llagan, Isabels Dragon Twelve Builders and Construction Supply jArranz St., Calamagui 2nd 2,995,412.99 1/18/2022 167 Calendar Days
Re-programming 2021 s City of llagan, Isabela
Consiruction of 6-Units Modular Steel Isclation Facility at Mr. Jonathan L. Diaz
3 |Milagros Albano District Hospital - 1,799,999.88 Cabagan, lsabela Dragon Twelve Builders and Construction Supply {Arranz St., Calamagui 2nd 1,795,544.65 1/18/2022 106 Calendar Days
Re-programming 2021 \ City of llagan, Isabela
Construction of 13-Units Modular Steel Isolation Facility at Mr. Jonathan L. Diaz
4 IManuel A. Roxas District Hospital - 3,899,999.65 Roxas, Isabela Dragon Twelve Builders and Construction Supply |Arranz St., Calamagui 2nd 3,895,156.69 1/18/2022 230 Calendar Days
Re-programming 2021 * City of llagan, lsabela
Construction of 6-Units Modular Steel Isolation Facility at Mr. Jonathan L. Diaz
5 |Cauayan District Hospital - 1,799,999.88 Cauayan City, Isabela Dragon Twelve Builders and Construction Supply |Arranz St., Calamagui 2nd 1,795,544.65 1/18/2022 106 Calendar Days
Re-programming 2021 City of llagan, lsabela
Construction of 6-Units Modular Steel Isclation Facility at Mr. Jonathan L. Diaz
6 |Echague District Hospital - 1,799,999.88 Echague, Isabela Dragon Twelve Builders and Construction Supply |Arranz St., Calamagui 2nd 1,795,544.65 1/18/2022 106 Calendar Days
Re-programming 2021 City of llagan, Isabela
Construction of 7-Units Modular Steel Isolation Facility at Mr. Jonathan L. Diaz
7 |Provincial Capitol Compound - 2,099,999.48 City of llagan, Isabela Dragon Twelve Builders and Construction Supply |Arranz St., Calamagui 2nd 2,095,089.80 1/18/2022 120 Calendar Days
Re-programming 2021 City of lagan, Isabela
Drilling/Installation of Water System with Submersible Eivst Falied Bikidin
8  |Pump of Palanan Station Hospital - 300,000.00 Palanan, Isabela (J; b'x:::xbmitte dg) N/A N/A 1/18/2022 7 Calendar Days
Re-programming 2021 \
Repainting of Office & Replacement of Doors at Cabagan First Failed Bidding
9 : A N/A 1/18/2022 30 Calendar Days
Breeding Station - PGO MOOE SRR RN ER {No bid submitted) i a8 Y
10 Repair of Comfort Room at Cabagan Breeding Station - PGO 178,282.25 Eabsgan,; isbels First F.ai!ed BK.idmg N/A N/A 1/18/2022 12 Calendar Days
MOOE R {No bid submitted)
Mr. lonathan L. Diaz
Construction of D i
ff |[censhustionot Datnagen Jlepepratection siong Bagshiag 4,999,999.81 Sto. Tomas, Isabela Dragon Twelve Builders and Construction Supply [Arranz St., Calamagui 2nd 4,994,965,10 1/19/2022 90 Calendar Days
Creek - LGSF-DRRAP )
X City of llagan, Isabela
Construction of Damaged Slope Protection al Unio SO Lt Eae
12 € e FrpieRnionE Hnlon 4,999,999.81 Cabagan, Isabela Dragon Twelve Builders and Construction Supply |Arranz St., Calamagui 2nd 4,994,965.10 1/19/2022 80 Calendar Days

Creek - LGSF-DRRAP \

City of llagan, Isabela
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Name of Project Pl Location | Winning Bidder/ Lowest Calculated Bidder Contract Amount ‘Bidding Date | Contract Duration
’ " ) Mr. Jonathan L. Diaz
13 CoftHicsian of Danidged Slopeibrotection along Magass| 4,999,999,92 Cabagan, isabela Dragon Twelve Builders and Construction Supply |Arranz 5t., Calamagui 2nd 4,995,110.12 1/18/2022 90 Calendar Days
Creek - LGSF-DRRAP .
City of llagan, Isabela
Construction of Damaged Slope Protection along Cansa VRSN £
14 aged »iop [EHEICE n 4,999,999.92 Cabagan, Isabela Dragon Twelve Builders and Construction Supply |Arranz St., Calamagui 2nd 4,995,110.12 1/19/2022 90 Calendar Days
Creek - LGSF-DRRAP :
g City of llagan, Isabela
: ! : Mr. Jonathan L. Diaz
15 |Construction of Damaged Slope Protection along Tallag-Saui 4,999,999.81 Cabagan, Isabela Dragon Twelve Builders and Construction Supply |Arranz St., Calamagui 2nd 4,994,965.10 1/19/2022 90 Calendar Days
Creek - LGSF-DRRAP « .
City of lagan, Isabela
i 5 Mr. Jonathan L. Diaz
15 |eonstruction’sf Damaged Slope Pratection slong Aggub- 4,999,999.92 Cabagan, lsabela Dragon Twelve Builders and Construction Supply |Arranz St., Calamagui 2nd 4,995,110.12 1/19/2022 90 Calendar Days
Saui Creek - LGSF-DRRAP :
City of ilagan, Isabela
; : } - Mr. Jonathan L. Diaz
17 Construction of Damaged Slope Protection along Sitlo 4,999,999.97 Cabagan, isabela Dragon Twelve Builders and Construction Supply |Arranz St., Calamagui 2nd 4.983,901.93 1/18/2022 90 Calendar Days
Compra Creek - LGSF-DRRAP )
City of llagan, Isabela
Constructi D 45| ———— Mall Mr. Richard Stephensun 1. Almiren
ek e Ll S e B 4,999,999,97 Aurora, Isabela R.S.K.M. Construction Services Purok 1, Brgy. Camaal, Quirino, 4,969,145.81 1/19/2022 90 Calendar Days
Creek - LGSF-DRRAP |
Isabela
i |Construction of Modular Steel House to be used as First Failed Bidding \
18} : isabel N/A 1/19/2022 115 Calendar Days
\ *°) |quarantine Facilities - LGSF-DRRAP i g {No bid submitted) N/a / 118/ . Y
e
. & o ; ’ ; , : Ms. Daisy G. Bedafia
g jEAension andimprovenentiol Provineal Bnginess's ifice:- 1,978,641.20 e i i v RD BedaRa Construction Christine Village, Phase 2 1,970,826.11 1/19/2022 70 Calendar Days
PGQ Capital Outlay City of llagan, Isabela R
Cauayan City. isabela
. " - Ms. Daisy G. Bedafia
; ] ol
pg [CHORAIGGHPRNIAENI BStor Pl Repslh Say el 199999936 | Frovincial Capitol Compaund, RD Bedafia Construction Christine Village, Phase 2 1,991,939.27 1/18/2022 | 82 Calendar Days
PGO Capital Outlay City of ilagan, Isabela .
Cauayan City. isabela
Construction of Look Out Tower, llagan - Divilacan, Refo. . Second Failed Bidding
2 ) K ! City of it , Isabel N/A 2/14/2022 14 Calendar Days
2 |area 1 (2nd Bid) - DBP Loan 293,390.53 ¥aliiagan; lseoei {No bid submitted) N/A / L ar aw
\
Construction of Look Gut Tower, llagan - Divilacan, Refo. ; Second Failed Bidding
23 ’ ! 3 City of llagan, Isabela N/A 2/14/2022 14 Calendar Days
Area 2 (2nd Bid) - DBP Loan T ity ot flag € (No bid submitted) R / /2y Y
Construction of Look Out Tower, llagan - Divilacan, Refo. ) Second Failed Bidding
! ! City of il Isabel N/A 2/14/2022 14 Calendar Days
24 Area 3 (2nd Bid) - DBP Loan 249,999.99 ity of llagan, Isabela (No bid submitted) N/A V7 /14/ y
\
Construction of Lock Out Tower, lagan - Divilacan, Refo. ; Second Failed Bidding
’ ! City of il , Isabel A N/A 2/14/2022 14 Calendar Days
& Area 4 (2nd Bid) - DBP Loan PERIER EEIREA e {No bid submitted) B / i ¥
Maintenance & Improvement of Canal-Access Road of Ms. Aurea F. Manuel
26 |Completed Small Water Impounding Project (SWIP) - EDF 1,499,999.04 Santos, Quezon, isabela  |A. F. Manuel Construction Inc. #58 Quezon St., Brgy. 02 1,498,550.81 2/14/2022 58 Calendar Days




| Wm&ﬁudmrf'ar: |5

- EDF 2022

City of llagan, Isabela

Name of Project by Location Winning Bidder/ Lowest Calculated Bidder Name and Address  Contract Amount  Bidding Date | Contract Duration
- Ms. Aurea F. Manuel
Maintenance & Improvement of Completed Small Water
27 e - ;
Impounding Project (SWIP) - EDF 2021 99,999.57 Aguinaldo, Naguilian, Isabela {A. F. Manuel Construction Inc. #58 Quezon St., Brgy. 02 99,656.84 2/14/2022 20 Calendar Days
San Mateo, Isabela
i Ms. Aurea F. Manuel
Maintenance & Improvement of Completed Small Water
28 : i ili i
Impounding Project {SWIP) - EDF 2021 99,999.57 Manaring, Naguilian, Isabela A, F. Manue! Construction Inc. #58 Quezon St., Brgy. 02 99,607.62 2/14/2022 20 Calendar Days
San Mateg, Isabela
. Ms. Aurea F. Manuel
Maintenance & Improvement of Completed Smali Water
29 | g . .
Impounding Project (SWIP) - EDF 2021 199,999.14 San Jose, Jones, isabela A. F. Manuel Construction inc. #58 Quezon St., Brgy. 02 199,615.79 2/14/2022 25 Calendar Days
San Mateo, Isabela
: : : : Mr. Jimmy T. Chua
Repair/improvement of Fingerlings Production and .
30 ; ; . . !
Marketing Enterprise Facilities - Reprogramming 2021 4,999,399.30 Cordon, Isabela isabela EBC Builders Construction, inc. ::af;oIWest, Santiago City, 4,997,663.56 2/24/2022 180 Calendar Days
sabela
. y - Mr. Narciso L. Bilayon, Ir.
Improvement of Mungbean Production & Marketing Facility ’
31 ; . . ) e "
Fence - Reprogramming 2021 1,144,008.80 San Mateo, Isabela AHB Construction & Supply Brgy. Capirpirawan, Cordon, 1,141,194.84 2/24/2022 60 Calendar Days
isabela
e « Mr. lonathan L. Diaz
Dredging/Desilting of Aggub-5an fuan Creek
32 i EDFgZ ng 3 8ot Agg 9,999,999.42 Cabagan, isabela Dragon Twelve Builders and Construction Supply {Arranz St., Calamagui 2nd 9,890,7590.75 3/16/2022 180 Calendar Days
City of tlagan, 1sabela
; o Mr. Jonathan L. Diaz
Dredging/Desilting of Ballacayu Creek /
33 _ EDFEZOEZZ & Y 14,999,999,52 San Pablo, Isabela Dragon Twelve Builders and Construction Supply |Arranz St., Calamagui 2nd 14,986,037.79 3/16/2022 255 Calendar Days
City of lagan, tsabela
. JE Mr. Jonathan L. Diaz
Dredging/Desilting of Balug Creek ;
34 ; EDngogZ‘z g % 14,999,999.93 Tumauini, Isabela Dragon Twelve Builders and Construction Supply |Arranz St., Calamagui 2nd 14,989,540.19 3/16/2022 255 Calendar Days
City of llagan, Isabela
; i P Mr. Jonathan L. Diaz
Dredging/Desilting of Creek Lingaling - Carague )
35 - EDFgZOgZZ & =R B 14,999,599.84 Sta. M, aria, isabela Dragon Twelve Builders and Construction Supply |Arranz St., Calamagui 2nd 14,986,365.29 3/16/2022 283 Calendar Days
City of llagan, isabela
) - Mr. Jonathan L. Diaz
Dredging/Desilting of Culialabo Creek
36 | EDFgZDgzz o 9,899,999.35 Sto. Tomas, isabela Dragon Twelve Builders and Construction Supply |Arranz St., Calamagui 2nd 9,990,566.21 3/16/2022 180 Calendar Days
City of llagan, Isabela
: - Mr. Jonathan L. Diaz
Dredging/Desilting of Mabangug Creek
37 i EDFg20g22 g gug 4,999,999,84 Cabagan, isabela Dragon Twelve Builders and Construction Supply {Arranz St., Calamagui 2nd 4,993,605.80 3/16/2022 90 Calendar Days
City of llagan, isabela
; s - Mir. Jonathan L. Diaz
Dredging/Desilting of Sitio Compra Creek
38 ] EDngogZZ & e 4,999,998.92 Cabagan, lsahela Dragon Twelve Builders and Construction Supply {Arranz St., Calamagui 2nd 4,993,180.83 3/16/2022 112 Calendar Days
City of Hagan, Isabela
; —_— " ) Mr. Jonathan L. Diaz
Dredging/Desilting of Calinaoan Creek (Phase I}
39 EDL;gZOiZ & { ) 44,999,993.56 Delfin Albano, Isabela Dragon Twelve Builders and Construction Supply |Arranz St., Calamagui 2nd 44,961,800.54 3/16/2022 436 calendar Days
City of llagan, isabela
' Dredging/Desilting of GOC Creek bk domathant Blae
40 9,599,999.17 Gamu. Isabela Dragon Twelve Builders and Construction Supply [Arranz St., Calamagui 2nd 9,990,833.15 3/16/2022 184 calendar Days
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Name and Addrass

Bidding Date

e Location Winning Bidder/ Lowest Calculated Bidder Contract Aniount ' Contract Duration
’ - i Mr. Jonathan L. Diaz
a DéeDdf;;i/ZD“'m"g of LaiiatyPeguefio Creek 9,999,999.08 Reina mercedes, Isabela | Dragon Twelve Builders and Construction Supply |Arranz St., Calamagui 2nd 9,989,386.58 3/16/2022 | 192 Calendar Days
3 City of llagan, Isabela
- o g Mr. Jonathan L. Diaz
42 D;;‘ig;ggzg DS pATSITIRERIY RN (M uiadl) 9,999,999.21 Angadanan, isabela Dragon Twelve Builders and Construction Supply |Arranz St., Calamagui 2nd 9,990,529.54 3/16/2022 | 188 Calendar days
\ City of llagan, Isabela
a3 Rehabilitation of Quezon - Sto. Tomas Provincial Road - EDF 84,999,099.76 Gtz 88, Toman isabiels First faxled Bifﬂdmg N/A N/A 3/16/2022 456 eslendar Deys
2022 \ {No bid submitted)
; s : ! Mr. Jonathan L. Diaz
44 Dé:ﬁggz/z DR FERF R IR Ureek fFase B) 4,999,999.23 Gamu. Isabela Dragon Twelve Builders and Construction Supply |Arranz St., Calamagui 2nd 4,994,544.65 3/16/2022 93 Calendar Days
\ City of llagan, isabela -
2

We hereby certify that we have reviewed the contents and hereby attest to the veracity and correctness of the data or information contained in this docurnent.

MS. ELSA M. PASTRANA
BAC Member fi

BAC Chairman

MS, LUCILA M. AMBATAL!

ATTY. JO YAI\%RID

BAC Vife Chairman

BAC Member




